
  International Journal of Academic Research in Business and Social Sciences 
        2017, Vol. 7, No. 6 

ISSN: 2222-6990 

 
 

761 
www.hrmars.com 
 
 

Electronic Cigarettes as a Smoking Cessation or as a 
Gateway to Start Smoking? 

 
Nurul Husna Akhmar1*, Hanum Hassan2 

Norhasyikin Rozali3, Siti Intan Diyana Ishak4, Alia Ashrani Azmi5 

1* 3 4 5 Postgraduates Students & 2  Senior Lecture School Of Human Development and 
Techocommunication (iKOM), Pusat Pengajian Unimap, Perlis 

(Correspondence: husnarmies@gmail.com)1* 

 
DOI:  10.6007/IJARBSS/v7-i6/3035   URL:  http://dx.doi.org/10.6007/IJARBSS/v7-i6/3035 
 
Abstract 
Nowadays, the use of electronic cigarettes are increasingly popular among teens and adults. 
Electronic cigarettes use battery power to operate. Electronic cigarettes function is very similar 
to a conventional cigarette, namely supply of nicotine to the user. However, the electronic 
cigarette does not produce smoke but vapor to be inhaled. The objectives of the concept paper 
is to examine the effectiveness of using electronic cigarettes as an aid to stop smoking or as a 
tool to initiate smoking activities. The  method use for this conceptual paper by using secondary 
data resources at online database and library collection. Finding show from this conceptual 
paper is a great need in designing strategies to deal with the increased use of electronic 
cigarettes. In order to conclude, more studies related to electronic cigarettes should be carried 
out to teenagers and adults. In addition, studies to look at the safety of the use of electronic 
cigarettes in the long term should be carried out. 
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Introduction 
Electronic cigarettes are electronic devices that deliver nicotine in vapor form, which includes a 
variety of products, shapes and sizes. There is a small-sized electronic cigarette which 
resembles like a regular cigarette and there are also medium-sized electronic cigarette which 
resembles a pen and known as e-hookahs and vape pen. Electronic cigarettes, also known as 
electronic nicotine delivery systems (ENDS), e-hookah and vape. The electronic cigarette has a 
large tank known as personal Vaporisers (APVs), also known as modes. The electronic cigarette 
works by using battery power where propylene glycol containing nicotine and flavorings is 
heated to create an aerosol to be inhaled (Grana, Benowitz & Glantz, 2013). Electronic 
cigarettes are usually divided into three main parts, namely battery, heating element, and a 
cartridge or tank. Electronic cigarettes are designed to deliver nicotine to smokers without the 
combustion of conventional tobacco products. However, there is also the electronic cigarette 
does not contain nicotine. 
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The electronic cigarette was invented in 2003 by a pharmacist Hon Lik in China. The electronic 
cigarette first appeared in China in 2004 and the same year, electronic cigarettes sold online 
(Solheim, Papa dan Lefton, 2014) . The electronic cigarette was introduced in the US market in 
2007 (Yamin, Bitton, & Bates, 2010). The popularity of electronic cigarettes are becoming 
increasingly popular with its growth in countries such as the United States, sales of electronic 
cigarettes in the United States in 2007 was $ 5 million and up to 2014 sales to 2.2 billion dollars 
(Kornfield, Huang, Vera, & Emery, 2015). Even an increase in promotional expenses (Kornfield 
et al., 2015) has also led to an ad about electronic cigarettes appear across multiple media 
channels, especially television, billboards and social media that cause electronic cigarettes 
spread rapidly and widely among the population in the United States. In 2013 up to 2014 by 
81% of youth use electronic cigarettes as interesting flavors on the electronic cigarette (Centers 
for Disease Control and Prevention, 2013).  
 

Electronic Cigarette As a Tool to Help Smoker Stop Smoking 
Electronic cigarettes are often sold as smoking aids (Tan, Bigman, & Sanders-Jackson, 2014). 
The study was done by Etter and Bullen (2011) found that electronic cigarettes are used 
primarily by ex-smokers as an aid to smoking cessation. These aids are used as a way to avoid 
smokers to abstain from smoking cessation attempt. Studies show that as much as 51% of users 
consider electronic cigarettes, and potentially useful to help them stop smoking. These aids are 
used as a way to avoid smokers to abstain from smoking cessation attempt. Moreover, 
Dockrell, Morrison, Bauld and McNeill (2013) also found that the use of electronic cigarettes in 
the British is as a measure of smokers attempt to quit smoking. This is because as many as 
170,000 people in British smokers have switched to electronic cigarettes. The use of electronic 
cigarettes among adults who had never smoked at the British also found is very little. Dockrell, 
Morrison, Bauld and McNeill (2013) argues that British smokers will benefit the disclosure of 
information about the effectiveness of the use of electronic cigarettes at the same time can 
improve the health of the public against the use of conventional cigarettes. 
 
In Barbeau, Barbeau, Burda and Siegel (2013) research abaout  the effectiveness of the use of 
electronic cigarette nicotine replacement therapy compared to electronic cigarette users who 
successfully quit smoking. Smokers were found to be difficult to stop smoking when nicotine 
therapy. They reportedly often failed repeatedly when using the nicotine patch, nicotine gum, 
and medications that controlled for smoking cessation. However, after switching to electronic 
cigarettes they managed to avoid a conventional cigarette where the effect is more dangerous 
to themselves and the public. Therefore, electronic cigarettes may be effective as an aid to stop 
smoking (Brown, Beard, Kotz, Michie, & West, 2014; Bullen et al., 2010b; R Polosa et al., 2011; 
Riccardo Polosa, Rodu, Caponnetto, Maglia, & Raciti, 2013).  
 
The use of electronic cigarettes provide a different experience compared to conventional 
cigarette smoking experience. In the study of Chen, Zhu and Conway (2015) about the 
discussion of electronic cigarettes and shisha users in online communities have found that 
typically, smokers who want to quit smoking will experience psychological warfare whether to 
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quit or return to conventional cigarettes. The situation is different with smokers who switch to 
using electronic cigarettes as a tool to quit smoking. They do not suffer from psychological 
warfare to stop because the electronic cigarette has successfully turned their attention from 
conventional cigarettes. 
 
Bullen and colleagues (2013) conducted a study of 657 people in New Zealand smokers 
motivated to quit smoking. They were divided into three groups where the first group to use 
the electronic cigarette which contains 16 milligrams (mg) of nicotine, the second group of 
electronic cigarettes does not contain nicotine, and the third group with 21 mg nicotine patch 
therapy. The study found that 7.3% of the group of electronic cigarettes containing nicotine are 
still continuing therapy while the electronic cigarette does not contain nicotine consisting of 
4.1% and 5.8% of study participants from the 21 mg nicotine patch therapy was continued. The 
study showed that electronic cigarettes are moderately effective in helping smokers motivated 
to quit smoking. 
 
However in another study conducted by Caponnetto, Auditore, Russo, Cappello and Polosa 
(2013) using 300 smokers who were motivated to quit smoking as a sample. The samples were 
divided into three groups which is group A with electronic cigarette with 7.2 mg nicotine for 12 
weeks, while group B used the electronic cigarette with 7.2 mg for 6 weeks and 6 weeks 
remaining nicotine levels derived at 5.4 mg, and group C with cigarette electronic which does 
not contain nicotine for 12 weeks. A significant reduction of tobacco use in each study group in 
the first week. But the difference can be seen in the 52nd week in which 13% of group A 
continued therapy, while 9% of Kumpalan B and 4% of group C. According to the study, the use 
of electronic cigarettes in smokers who are motivated to stop smoking addicted smokers to 
reduce cravings and promote the cessation of smoking conventional continuous without any 
side effects. 
 
Dawkins, Turner, Hasna and Soar, (2012) conducted a study with 86 smokers on electronic 
cigarette use contains 18 mg nicotine and cigarettes do not contain nicotine. Electronic 
cigarettes were found to reduce the desire to smoke after the study participants used an 
electronic cigarette for 20 minutes. In the study, it was found that the use of electronic 
cigarettes containing biotin is important for smokers who comprise men. 
 
In a study conducted by Bullen and colleagues, (2010) of 40 smokers have used four methods of 
electronic cigarettes containing 16 mg of nicotine, electronic cigarettes does not contain 
nicotine, nicotine inhaler, and conventional cigarettes. In the study it was found that study 
participants who use the electronic cigarette contains 16 mg of nicotine less desire to smoke 
compared to study participants who use the electronic cigarette does not contain nicotine and 
can not be differences of study participants who use the nicotine inhaler and conventional 
cigarettes. The use of electronic cigarettes containing nicotine is 16 mg reduced the desire to 
return a cigarette smoker. This is because the electronic cigarette has been supplying the needs 
nicotine to smokers to get rid of a conventional cigarette addiction. 
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Polosa and colleagues (2011) have used electronic cigarettes containing nicotine 7.4 mg of 40 
smokers who are not motivated to smoke. It was found that there was a 50% reduction in the 
number of conventional cigarettes smoked by 12.5% of study participants during the week of 
the 24th, while 22.5% of study participants still continue therapy with the use of electronic 
cigarettes containing 7.4 mg of nicotine without conventional cigarettes. Moreover, in another 
study Polosa and colleagues (2013) have extended the review period from 24 weeks to 24 
months and found that 12.5% of study participants managed to reduce the use of conventional 
cigarettes for more than 50% of daily consumption, while 12.5% of study participants still 
continue therapy without conventional cigarettes. The use of electronic cigarettes in the long 
term among smokers who are not ready to quit smoking can reduce the consumption of 
conventional cigarettes on a daily basis. 
 
Caponnetto, Auditore, Russo, Cappello and Tolosa (2013) conducted a study of 14 patients with 
schizophrenia who smoke and do not intend to stop smoking. Study participants are supplied 
with electronic cigarettes that contain 7.4 mg nicotine. The study was conducted over 12 
months. In the week to 52 found that there was a reduction of 50% use of conventional 
cigarettes per day by 50% of study participants, while 14.3% of study participants still continue 
to use the electronic cigarette contains 7.4 mg of nicotine without conventional cigarettes. The 
use of electronic cigarettes causes a decrease in the use of conventional cigarettes is significant 
in patients with schizophrenia who do not plan to stop smoking without causing side effects to 
the study participants. 
 
Franck, Budlovsky, Windle, Filion and Eisenberg (2014) conducted a study to evaluate the 
efficacy and safety of electronic cigarettes as a smoking cessation aid. Promoting the use of 
electronic cigarettes as a smoking cessation has been studied in two groups of children (King, 
Alam, Promoff, Arrazola, & Dube, 2013; Pearson, Richardson, Niaura, Vallone, & Abrams, 2012; 
Pepper & Brewer, 2014; Sutfin, McCoy, Morrell, Hoeppner, & Wolfson, 2013) and adolescents 
(Dutra & Glantz, 2014; Pepper et al., 2013). 
 
Nevertheless, there is still no research to confirm the electronic cigarette devices for smoking 
cessation (Franck, Budlovsky, Windle, Filion & Eisenberg, (2014). The presence of nicotine in 
liquid form has increased confidence smokers to use electronic cigarettes as smoking cessation 
aids (Barbeau et al., 2013; Caponnetto, Polosa, Auditore, Russo, & Campagna, 2011). 

 
Electronic Cifgarette as a Gateway to Start Smoking 
While electronic cigarettes are used as devices to smokers to quit smoking however, there are 
opinions that say that electronic cigarettes as a way for young people to start smoking 
(Trtchounian & Talbot, 2011). This is due to the desire to try electronic cigarettes is higher 
among youth after watching advertisement about the difference between the use of 
conventional cigarettes and electronic cigarettes (Pepper, Emery, Ribisl, Southwell, & Brewer, 
2014). 



  International Journal of Academic Research in Business and Social Sciences 
        2017, Vol. 7, No. 6 

ISSN: 2222-6990 

 
 

765 
www.hrmars.com 
 
 

 
Nowadays, many young adults are aware of the presence of the phenomenon of electronic 
cigarettes. Many of them are willing to try the electronic cigarette despite many studies 
showing the dependency of smokers to electronic cigarettes as a source of nicotine addiction. 
The phenomenon of electronic cigarettes causing many young people have the intention to 
start using electronic cigarettes (Pepper et al., 2013). 
 
Yang, Salmon, Pang and Cheng (2015) in a study on media exposure and intentions to smoke 
among adolescents shows that media exposure of adolescents have a positive relationship in 
increasing desire for smoke. The youth is the largest in Twiiter. Marketing of electronic 
cigarettes in Twitter will lead the youth who do not smoke will also be interested to try 
electronic cigarettes (Huang et al., 2014). In addition, the study found that teens who reported 
smoking more likely to try electronic cigarettes after viewing smoking-related electronic 
(Adkison et al., 2013; Pearson et al., 2012; Pepper et al., 2013; Regan, Promoff, Dube, & 
Arrazola, 2011). 
 
Shiplo, Czoli and Hammond (2015) found that 10% to 30% of electronic cigarette users never 
conventional cigarettes before using the electronic cigarette. In the study Dutra and Glantz 
(2014) showed that the use of electronic cigarettes is associated with the use of conventional 
high smoking among adults and adolescents. In two other studies also found that users of 
electronic cigarettes was found to have the intention to start mneghisap conventional 
cigarettes and openness to start on conventional cigarettes at any time. (Bunnell et al., 2015; 
Coleman et al., 2015). 
  

Conclusion 
Electronic cigarette utilize is related with higher rates of smoking initiation among youths, even 
among the individuals who might somehow or another have no slant to smoke. There is an 
enormous need to plan strategies that address the rising commonness of electronic cigarette 
utilize and re-standardization of smoking conduct to ensure our who and what is to come. The 
nonappearance of information on long haul security ought not be likened with wellbeing; such 
was the situation with cigarettes in the most recent century. 
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